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To the Editor: 
 
Obesity is a chronic disease, which has been con-
sidered as the epidemic of the XXI century1. Its 
spread is produced from highly industrialized 
countries towards those of low economic and in-
dustrial potential, and it is a responsibility of health 
services and systems globally. This epidemic has 
particularly affected the female sex, to the point that 
in 2014 about 15% of the world's female population 
was obese2, a situation doubly threatening because 
of the risk of perpetuating this condition in succes-
sive generations through reproduction; responsi-
bility that lies in pregnant women with overweight, 
to which it is added that, in recent decades, more 
and more women reach conception in overweight or 
obese condition3.   

The relationship between obesity and cardiovas-
cular disease is complex due to the several patho-
physiological mechanisms involved and the large 
number of interrelated factors4. Obesity can cause 
high blood pressure, type 2 diabetes mellitus and 
coronary atherosclerosis (also by the presence of 
dyslipidemia), although evidence of such an asso-
ciation can include many other factors such as: 
subclinical inflammation, neurohormonal activation 
with increased sympathetic tone, high concentra-
tions of leptin and insulin, obstructive sleep apnea 
and increased exchange of free fatty acids, and also 
ectopic deposition of adipose tissue in specific areas 
of the body, such as the myocardium, large vessels, 

renal arteries and the hepatic parenchyma; which 
can cause atheromatous deposits, that detected 
early, contribute to the primary prevention of car-
diovascular disease, which is particularly important 
in a vulnerable stage to obesity and central fat 
distribution, such as pregnancy5. 

In the specific case of waist circumference, al-
though its measurement is useful in the estimation of 
central adiposity, it requires more precise methods 
to detect differences even among obese people who 
show similar values of this indicator and general 
adiposity comparable by the values of the body 
mass index (BMI). It has also been found possible to 
identify two different patterns of distribution of adi-
pose tissue: one in which the subcutaneous cellular 
tissue is low, as most of it is accumulated in the 
intraperitoneal compartment; and another, in which 
the fat is deposited almost primarily in the subcuta-
neous space. This explains how to the classic indi-
cators of body and abdominal fat are added others, 
such as indexes and visceral body fat, and waist/ 
height index, which have been recognized as an-
thropometric parameters more useful than the ones 
previously used in the prediction of cardiovascular 
disease and metabolic disorders6,7. 

A study published in 20148 reported the results of 
the waist/height index association to major cardio-
vascular risk factors in women between 50 and 60 
years, while it stated that it constitutes a simple and 
practical tool to guide nutritional care for women 
with increasing age and the distribution of abdo-
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minovisceral fat.  
The waist/height index is an alternative anthro-

pometric indicator able to identify metabolic risk 
factors where the BMI and waist/hip index were 
normal; in addition, it is recommended in the pre-
vention of diseases related to cardiovascular risk. 
Nevertheless, it is necessary to increase the works 
aimed at identifying the point of more sensitive 
assessment of excess of abdominovisceral fat, as 
well as to assess the risk of development of chronic 
non-communicable diseases to support its clinical 
utility, specifically for different population groups8. 
These anthropometric indicators are often used as 
indirect measurements of visceral fat in healthy 
population and their study also suggested during 
pregnancy9, as prevention of transgenerational per-
petuation of obesity10. 

They are also peculiarities associated with intra-
abdominal adipose localization, the effect on the 
endocrine-metabolic system, higher than the overall 
amount of adipose tissue11, predisposing to diabetes 
and cardiovascular disease. Specifically, visceral 
adiposity is associated with insulin resistance, dia-
betes, dyslipidemia, systemic inflammation, hyper-
tension, myocardial infarction and many other 
causes of death12. 

The risks of obesity for pregnant women have dif-
ferent connotations depending on the characteristics 
of the distribution of adipose tissue in their body 
although the cause-effect relation has not been fully 
clarified. 

Regardless of the woman's BMI before pregnan-
cy, the deposit of fat during pregnancy usually pre-
dominates in the central and preferably perivisceral 
location, with great impact on the cardiometabolic 
risks13, a fact that has been extensively studied in 
the last decades.  

A meta-analysis presented early this century14 

reports the consensus on cardiovascular protection 
of pregnant women that exceed their body weight, 
with actions from the first quarter in which the 
cardiac function is evaluated, as in the second, as 
well as performing a Doppler ultrasound of the 
uterine arteries around the 23rd week of gestation 
(22-24), as part of identifying the preeclampsia.  

A brief reflection about the gravity that may be 
present in this area is what we have wanted to pres-
ent to the scientific community through the CorSalud 
pages. In a study, in a health area of the municipality 
of Santa Clara, Cuba, when registering pregnancy 
women with the family doctor, in 883 supposedly 
healthy pregnant women between 20 and 29 years of 

age, it was found that while 59.2% of women arrived 
to their pregnancy with an adequate nutritional 
status, because of their BMI, 51% were classified as 
obese and 26.8% reached the limit condition accord-
ing to the percentage of fat in their body composi-
tion; indicating that about 80% of pregnant women 
had the proportion body fat in excess at the begin-
ning of the pregnancy, even though according to the 
classification done –by national indication of the 
Mother and Child Care Program, the traditional BMI– 
a much better overview was found15.  

In this sample, the waist/height index exceeded 
the limits of cardiovascular risk in 738 pregnant 
women, representing 83.6% of the sample of the heal-
thy pregnant women studied; matching results with 
the reported in other contexts, but referring to 
women of older ages8. 

These findings call for reflection on the need to 
be alert in the adiposity of pregnant women, their 
regional distribution and anthropometric assess-
ments, sometimes to early warning potential risks to 
the health of the mother and the result of the gesta-
tion.  
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